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Albertsons Market presents The Storehouse New Mexico with a check for $14,300 following 

fundraising campaign 
 ALBUQUERQUE, N.M. — On Wednesday, Albertsons Market team members presented a check to 
The Storehouse New Mexico for $14,343.26 which will provide more than 71,000 meals for those 
struggling with food insecurity across the community. 
  
Albertsons Market ran the donate-at-the-register campaign in October to raise money to support 
the mission of The Storehouse New Mexico. Whether it’s campaigns like this one or the donation for 
fresh produce and other food, Albertsons Market is always looking to support organizations battling 
hunger and food insecurity. 
  
“We are proud to continue our tradition of supporting The Storehouse New Mexico,” said Carlos 
Hernandez, regional vice president for The United Family. “I’m so thankful to our loyal guests who 
helped us raise these funds. We know just how much these donations mean to this organization and 
the families they serve.” 
  
The funds given to The Storehouse benefits New Mexico families and individuals who receive food 
assistance from them. As one of the largest food pantries in the state, The Storehouse serves 
approximately 55,000 people a year. 
  
“The Storehouse has been supporting record numbers of people this year so we greatly appreciate 
Albertsons Market and Market Street stores for hosting a fundraiser at their registers,” said Kevin 
Cochran, program manager for The Storehouse New Mexico. “This gift, made possible by the 
Albertsons Market team and their customers in central New Mexico, will provide over 71,000 meals 
to local families.” 
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About The United Family® 
 
In its 108th year of operation, United Supermarkets, LLC – d.b.a. The United Family® – is a 
Texas-based grocery chain with stores in 54 communities across Texas and New Mexico. A 
self-distributing company with headquarters and distribution centers in Lubbock, The United 
Family currently operates 99 retail grocery stores under four unique banners: United Supermarkets, 
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Market Street, Amigos, and Albertsons Market. It also operates 39 convenience stores under three 
unique banners: United Express, Market Street Express, and Albertsons Market Express. The United 
Family also includes ancillary operations R.C. Taylor Distributing, USM Manufacturing, and Llano 
Logistics. The company is a wholly-owned subsidiary of Albertsons Companies, Inc. For more 
information, please visit www.theunitedfamily.com. 
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